VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE

COUNCIL ACTION SUMMARY

INITIATED: Code Services DATE: April 5, 2005
(Name)
RECOMMENDATION FROM: FILE REF:
(Board or Department)
NATURE OF ACTION: STEPS NEEDED TO IMPLEMENT ACTION:
X Ordinance Motion to Adopt "AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING
THE 2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE", as
. Resolution presented.
_ Motion C(W
. Other
SUMMARY OF ITEM:

Adoption of the attached ordinance will adopt the 2000 International Building Code.

RECORD OF ACTION TAKEN:

I\wp8icas.05\2000-BldgCode



Building Code

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2000 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

BE IT ORDAINED by the Village Council of the Village of Downers Grove in DuPage County,

Tilinois, as follows: (Additions are indicated by (/' underline; deletions by strikeeut):

Section 1. That Section 7.7. is hereby amended to read as follows:

7.7. International Building Code--Adoption. »
The Building-Officials-and-Code-AdministratorsNationallntel nati

ational Code Council International

Building Code, as promulgated by Building -Officials -and Code -

e Council ("ICC"), being particularly the 19962000 edition thereof, is hereby adopted
for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations for the construction, alteration, removal, demolition,
equipment, use and occupancy, location and maintenance of buildings and structures, including permits and
penalties required for such purposes. The same is adopted in its entirety, save and except such portions as
are hereinafter deleted, modified or amended, and is, together with such amendments, incorporated as fully
as if set out at length herein, and shall control in the construction of all buildings and structures therein
regulated within the ¥Village. Said Building Code, as modified and amended, may be referred to for all
purposes as the "Downers Grove Building Code" or the "Building Code". At least one copy of said Code,
including such amendments to it as shall be enacted, shall be filed in the office of the Village Clerk, and
additional copies shall be available in the Code Services Department of the Village. (Ord. No. 1281, § 1,
Ord. No. 1586, § 1; Ord. No. 2143, § 2; Ord. No. 2584, § 2; Ord. No. 2857, § 2; Ord. No. 3184, § 2; Ord.
No. 3391, § 2.)

Section 2. That Section 7.8. is hereby amended to read as follows:

7.8. Definitions.

For the purposes of the Building Code, the following words and phrases shall have the meanings
respectively ascribed to them by this section:

Building official. The Director of Code Services of th

% ont Building : Do vent

e Village.
Grove Code Services Department.
Legal counsel or legal officer. The Village Attorney for the Village of Downers Grove.
Jurisdiction. The Village of Downers Grove. (Ord. No. 1281, § 8; Ord. No. 1586, § 8; Ord. No.
2143, § 3; Ord. No. 2544, § 2.)

Section 3. That Section 7.9. is hereby amended to read as follows:

7.9. Same--Amendments.
The deletions from and modifications and amendments to the Building Officials -and Code -
Administraters-National2000 International Building Code as referred to in Section 7-7 are the following:
@-M%M%%mwmmmmmmﬁm-

%M%M%%ﬂﬁ%ﬂd&%&%%ﬁ%ﬂﬁem&e-

Page 10f 18



Building Code

o the-operation ot a-bulding or steuctre-without-frst fling with the-building official-an-application-ia-
mmmamm%@%mmmmmm%%mm-
Wmmmmm&m%&mwwmw-
ApriH9,1965as-amended-—

@-SM&%M%%W%M%%%MW%H-

b%@ﬁ%%%ﬂdﬁﬂﬂg%%%%%&ﬂf&ewm——k%%eﬁ
stractares-on-the-samelot-that-are-to-remain:
Emmmmwmﬁmmaw-

B =S 3

fiking- I after inat ,%ﬂéﬁgﬂ%&lﬁﬂd&ﬂe-ﬁbj&&eﬂs%-&e%-ﬁd%w%ﬁe-
WW%%%WM%M%MW%M%W—
%ﬂﬁ%@%ﬂ%&%ﬂ%ﬁ&f&%ﬁh&ﬂﬂﬁ&%ﬁ&%%&%ﬂm%ﬁmmm
as-soon-as-practicable—

SectionH2-0-Fees
%m&m-%mmwmm&%w%@mﬁ
ith-thep ps-of-Seetion ofthe PDowt re-Munteipa ode-

: _ - - N . . e
L ”..f!.i ] ) ”t] ; .;l.ﬁi Eﬁj“l hict
(1) Section 101.1is-amended by deleting the same in its entirety.

(2) Section 101.4.1 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the

Page 2 of 18



Building Code

following:
101.4.4 Plunibing.
Fhe provisions of the

gpply to.the mstallgﬂon, altera

followmg
101.4:6_Fire Prevention.

The.provisions

following:
105.7 Placement of Permlt

completion of the project.

(8) Section 106.1 is amended by deletin
in lieu thereof the following:
106.1 Submittal Documents.
Construction documents she
The construction docwments shall:

following:
106.2 Site Plan. -

The construction documents submitted with the application |

site plan drawn and stamped by the Iilinois State registered Architect

drawing will.show the size and location of'the niew constructmn _the existing structures on the Slte and the

distances fr he lot lines.: A plat of surve st-acc any the site plan. In the cas ]
site plan or survey shall show the construction to be deinolished. The building official is :
 modify the requirement for a site plan-when the application for permit is-for alter. ion orgepair or when:

otherwise watranted.

Page 3 of 18



followmg
107.4 Termmatlon of Approval

gllowmg v
1086 Refunds.

109 3 Regmred Inspectlons. B , , " o
For on-site ¢construction. from time to time the building official. upon.a 24-hournotification from

the per_m;t holder or hlS agent, hall make or cause to be made any 1 necessary’ msnechons dnd shall éither
; t Lk § e

: b: Poundgtlgn, prlor to backfill.
c. New construction, a spot surve
work being done.
. Plumibi s
eprebentatwe I8 requned to be Dresent for this inspection. )

ngpecggn ) ‘
_'f. Insulation. ¢
: 0, Electricgl cemhcculon »

1 Basement Floor
k Floom on Gmde

1. Fmal. {Contractorc

will be required by the Direct

ng Inxpector when itis cmn ‘ent the

Page 4 of 18



(al4) Section 4230112 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof
the following: o
Section 121:0-112.0 Board of Appeals

241121 Appointment.

There is hereby established in the municipality a board to be called the Board of Appeals,
consisting of seven members who are qualified by experience and training to pass upon matters pertaining to
building construction and who shall be appointed by the Village Manager, subject to the approval of the
Village Council. Members shall hold office for their designated terms and until their successors have
been appointed. The Village Manager shall designate one of the members to serve as chairman.

12+1:12.2 Term of office.

The Village Manager shall appoint eseven members for staggered terms of three years.
Vacancies shall be filled for an unexpired term in the manner in which the original appointments are
required to be made. Continued absence of any member from regular meetings of the board shall, at the
discretion of the Village Manager, render any such member liable to immediate removal from office by the
Village Manager. )

+24112.3 Affirmative votes.

TIn varying the application of any provision of this Code or in modifying an order of the
building official, affirmative votes of four members shall be required. No member of the board shall
passyote upon any question in which he, or any corporation in which he is a shareholder, is interested.

123112 .4 Meetings and records.

Meetings of the board shall be held at the call of the chairman and at such other times as
the board may determine. All hearings before the board shall be open to the public. The board shall keep
minutes of its proceedings, showing the vote of each member upon every question, or if absent or failing to
vote, indicating such facts, and shall also keep records of its examinations and other official action. Such
minutes and such records shall be public records.

123112.5 Procedure.

The board shall establish rules and regulations for its own procedure not inconsistent with
the provisions of this Code.

$2+112.6 Appeals.

a. Any person aggrieved or the head of any agency of the municipality may take an
appeal to the Board of Appeals from any decision of the building official.

b. An appeal may be taken within thirty days from the date of the decision
appealed, by filing with the building official and with the Board of Appeals a notice of appeal, specifying
the grounds thereof, except that in the case of a building or structure which in the opinion of the building
official, is unsafe or dangerous, the building official may in his order limit the time for such appeal to a
shorter period. The building official shall forthwith transmit to the Board of Appeals all the papers upon
which the action appealed from was taken.

12%112.7 Modifications and variations by the Board of Appeals.

a. The Board of Appeals, when so appealed to and after a public hearing, may vary
the application of any provision of this Code to any particular case when, in its opinion, the enforcement
thereof would do manifest injustice, and would be contrary to the spirit and purpose of this Code or public
interest, or when, in its opinion, the interpretation of the building official should be modified or reversed.

b. A decision of the Board of Appeals to vary the application of any provision of
this Code, or to modify an order of the building official, shall specify in what manner such variation or
modification is made, the conditions upon which it is made, and the reasons therefor.

3214112.8 Decisions of the Board of Appeals.

a. The Board of Appeals shall in every case reach a decision without unreasonable
or unnecessary delay. Every decision of the Board of Appeals shall be in writing and shall indicate the vote

Page 50f 18



Building Code

upon the decision. Every decision shall be promptly filed in the office of the building official and shall be
open to public inspection. A certified copy shall be sent by mail or otherwise to the appellant and a copy
shall be kept publicly posted in the office of the building official for 2 weeks after filing.

b. If a decision of the Board of Appeals reverses or modifies a refusal, order, or
disallowance of the building official, or varies the application of any provision of this Code, the building
official shall take action immediately in accordance with such decision.

121112.9 Appeals from decisions of the Board of Appeals.
A person aggrieved by a decision of said board, whether previously a party to the proceeding or not,
may, within 15 days after the filing of the decision in the office of the building official, applya appeal to the
appropriate court to correct errors of law in such decisions.

lieu.thereof-the followmg
I”anIS Stdte Plumbing Code-as adonted

1310.5-Use-Group-R-3-Structures:-Fhis-usegroup-shall-include-all-buildings-arrangedfor-

oceupaney-as-one—or-two-family-dwelling-units-and-includes-a-child-care-facility-which-aceommeodatesfive-
ef-less-ehﬁdfeﬂ-ef-aﬂy—age- -U-nlessetheﬁvme—pfeﬂded—hefemaﬂﬂuehﬂ%emfes%&ll—be-éeﬁgﬂedﬁ-

3—1—(—)—6—Use-G-reap-R—4-Stmemfes— iPh&s-use-gfeap-sha}}ﬂelude-a}}-detaeheé-eﬂe--er—ewe—
MW%M%M%%M%%WW%M%%
provisions-contained -inArticle H-of -Chapter14-of this-Code-- -Unless-otherwise-provided-herein;-all-such-
structures-shall-be-designed-in-accordance-with-the-Suburban-Building Officials-Conference-Building-Code-
as-adepted-and-amended-
G- %ﬁmﬁ%%m%m&%ﬁwﬁ%%w@p}y%mﬂd%
famly-éwe%hﬂgs{UﬁeGmups—Rﬁ.rﬂﬂdedmgdup}e*esaﬂdWe—ﬂa&& AH-ef—the-remamiﬂg

(k16) Section 403.1 is amended by deleting the second exception, therein reading —2- -Open parking -
structures(see-Seetion406-0)—

(417) Section 403.2 is amended by deleting the exceptions thereto in their entirety.

(m18) Section 403.67 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety, and substituting in lieu thereof the
following:

403.7 Fire Department Communication System.

A two-way Fire Department communication system shall be provided for Fire Department use. The
communication station shall operate between the central control system and every elevator cab, enclosed
stairway landing, emergency generator room, building engineer's office, fire pump room, remote alarm panel
and remote sprinkler riser locations.

The two-way communications system shall consist of a telephone system with plug-in handsets
capable of use in the designated jacks. Location of the jacks, zoning of the two-way communication system,
and the number of handsets required, will all be determined by the Fire Department.

lieuthereof the fo]lowmg o
Hlinois State Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village

Page 6of 18



Building Code

One -complete -set -of -AS BUHLT -fire -alarm -system -prints; -along -with -alarm system -
Handsets -for -Fire Department -communications -system; -propetly labeled; -and i loeked -
A-number-of -complete-sets-of keys-as-speeified -by-the Hire Department for-the -building;-
elevaters; -alarm -systens; -and -any -other keys -needed for -aecess -or -control -of -systems; -all Hnside -aJocked -
speettied -by the -FHire -Departinent- The -box shall-be secured -within-close -proximity-to-the fire -command -
FOORE:
(o)—Section-403-8-is-amended-by-deleting-the-words24-inches(610-mm)-by 76-inches-1930-mm)-
in -the -horizontal -open -pesition -and -substituting -in liew -thereof -the -words 30 -inches (762 -mm) by 76 -

. ép} &m%ﬂmwm—&mmmwmﬂgmm—m

(#21) Table 503 is amended by deleting therefrom all height limitations under the columns jointly labeled
"Types 3II and 4IV" and by substituting in lieu thereof a height limitation of thirty-five feet for all uses
under such columns.

Tables 503, 601 and 602 isare further amended by deleting the columns jointly labeled "Type SV."
in their entirety.

following:

901 6 Superwsorv Semces
connection tg the Vlllag
transmit-alarmrand trouble signals.

(t24) Sections 904—1—& through 994—9 03 2.12 are amended by deletlng the same in the1r entlrety and by
substituting in lieu thereof the following:
"904-1903.1 Where Required.

Page 7 of 18



Building Code

Automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed and maintained in full operating condition, as
specified in this code, in all buildings and structures, including open parking structures, regardless of street
frontage or fire walls, which exceed two stories or 25 feet in height or which have a total area in excess of
the applicable square footage listed in Table 964903.

TABLE 904903

Total area square footages above which installation of automatic sprinkler systems areis required:

Types of Construction

Use Group 1A, B.2A 2C 3A 3B 4
and 2B
A-1 Assembly, theaters 9;8440 63000 36620 63000 9.4500
A-2 Assembly, 28120 18600 24750 18000 27660
nightclubs and similar
uses )
A-3 Assembly (lecture 98440 6,3000 8,6620 6;3000 9:4560
halls recreation centers,
terminals, restaurants
other than night clubs) -
A-4 Assembly, 10,8000 16,8060 42,0000 12,0000 12,0000
churches
B Business 16;8751.500 16;8001.500 +4:8501.500 16:8001,500 +6;2061,500
E Educational 168755000  10:8005000  14:8055.000 10,8005.000 46:2005.000
F-1 Factory and 12505000 72005000  9:9005.000 72003000  $6:8005.000
industrial, moderate s
F-2 Factory and 16;8755.000 16;8005,000  +4:8565.000 10,8005.000 16;2005.000
industrial, low
H-1 High hazard, detonation hazards Automatic Sprinkler System Required In All
H-2 High hazard, deflagration hazards Automatic Sprinkler System Required In All
H-3 High hazard, physical hazards Automatic Sprinkler System Required In All
H-4 High hazard, health hazards Automatic Sprinkler System Required In All
I-1 Institutional, residential care Automatic Sprinkler System Required In All
I-2 Institutional, incapacitated Automatic Sprinkler System Required In All
I-3 Institutional, restrained Automatic Sprinkler System Required In All
M Mercantile 152502500 72002500 9:9002.500 72002,500  16:8602.500
R-1 Residential, hotels Automatic Sprinkler System Required In All
R-2 Residential, multiple-family Automatic Sprinkler System Required In All
ada acadapntad ad amandad in heactHon O/ of tha Dows za
Municipal Code.
S-1 Storage, moderate ~ 9:8445.000 6:3005.000 8.8625.000 6:3005.000 9.4505.000
S-2 Storage, low 16,8755.000 16;3605.000 14:8505.000 16:8065.000 6,2005.000
U Utility, misc. For accessory structures, the sprinkling requirements for the

corresponding principal use shall be used.

(825) Section 906-2-1903.3.1.1.1 is amended by adding the following exception at the conclusion thereof:
"36.Sprinklers may be omitted from attics, crawl spaces, floor ceiling spaces, and other concealed

Page 8 of 18



Building Code

spaces that are not used or intended for living purposes or storage.”

(26) Secti

Ireu ther

(w27)  Section 906:3903.3.53. is amended by adding at -the -conclusion -thereof the following
senteneesection:

903.3.5.3 Post Indication Valve Prohibited. “The use of post indicator valves and wall post indicator
valves are prohlblted -

—996%—1—-F&e—Pump- Whea-a—f&e-pump%&ns%aﬂeé%emet%he—hydfaukeﬂeeds-ef—anﬂueem&&e
mﬁ&%%%%%ﬂ%%%%%%mm
ng&eﬁmeﬁs&#ﬁa&%&e&ywmﬁeﬁe%mw

28 tion 903.:4.2.18 i i winge
903. 4 2. 1 Alamm Indicating Appllances., ﬂ

mounted over the fire department connectlon

(29} Section 903:4 3 is amended by deleting the word "hig
buildings".

(31) Section 903.7 is hereby added as follows:
-903.7 Hydraulic Nameplate. , , e _—
By ¢ach hydraulic: ated ¢ ach drawing provide :

8! ;andatory rggulremeg 1tS.

(34) Section 903.9.is hereby added as follows:

903.9 NFPA Standards - Adopted.
The following NEPA standards are héreby adopted:
a. NFPA. 14 Standpipe and Hose Systems. 2000 Edition
b. NEPA 20). Installation of Centrifugal Fire Pumps. 1999 edition

Page 9 of 18



Building Code

e NEPA 231, General Stot gge, 1998, edition.
f.-NFPA 231€.Rack:Storage: 1998 edition:
g. NFPA 231D. Storage of Rubber Tires, 1998 edi tlgn ‘

(35) Section 903.10 is hereby added as follows:

903.10 Fire Sprinkler System; Fire pump test header.
a. Add-provide-an OS& Y.control valve on fire Dumn 1n‘;ta1]atlgns,
= buProvide atilouitside test ‘ 5

(37) Section 903.12 is-hereby added as follows:

:903.12 Separate Zones Required. S
Manual Pulls, A/V and detectors to be on separate zones per floor.

903.15 Check Valve Required. -
- Provide a check valve in each sprinkler riser.

903.17 Warehouse Valves:

In all warehouse storage areas whiere storage exceeds 12! feet height, [ﬁb\h’dé inside 2.%5" fire hose
valves with 1 15" re ucer toal 1/2 conn c,tl n. cate h valves at-eac door entrance to: the warehgus

obstmcngns and/or racks on the drawing.

Page 10 of 18



Building Code

’ c. Where system pressures exceed 100 psi provide Potter reduced pressure field adjustable type

valve:

903 18 Single Fémllv Home Sprinkler Svstem%; R
- _Provide a minimum NFPA 13 D sprinkler system in all s

_Exception: detached single family homes

903.19 Addressable Fire Alarm bvstems

_All fire alarm systems shall be of the address blé

(46) Section
903 20 Crm

(47) Section 90321 is hereby added as follows:

903.21 XL. Thm Wall Plpe thlblted

thereot the following: o y
The National Electrical:Code as-adopted and amended by the Village.

following:
"22 feet”

(52)  Section 905.4 is amended by adding the. fgllgwmg, ‘

The number of risers for multi=story buildi ng g5 shall be such

905.7.3 Cabinet Equipment Specifications:
The connectlon shall: be not more than 5 feet above the floor and consist of 2 1[2 mch hose

Page 11 of 18



Building Code

pervi sed by a
and shall-

followmg
907.2 Where Reuulred

guantity to-activate a'smoke detector. -

(56) Section 907 2.1 1s amended by deleting the same in its entirety.

(57)__ Section 907.2.1 1 is hereby renumbered to 907.2.1

same in their entirety:

(59)__Section 907.2.6.2. is hiereby renumbered to 907.2.6.

(60) Section 907.2.8 is amended by deleting the same in its éntir y

lieu thereof

1!45 ! t‘t"

in addition to.
stems shiall be

rie"; Mfire al

roorm and sprmklgr room”,

Page 12 of 18



Building Code

thereof the following: o
& National Electrical Code as adopted and amended by the Village

(69) Section 907.8.2.is

thereof:
"40 f et”

recelvmg ‘paniel in
rvisory signals.

following:
Exceptions: "
1) Supervisory service is not required for automatic

dwellings. B S
2) In lieu of connecting to the Villaze’s alarm receivin

regulations for connectlon

(73) - Section 909.11 is amended by deleting the wor

thereof the following: o
National Electrical Code as adopted-and 2

the follgwmg
909. 12 1 ermg

(76) " Section'909.20.3 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety:

the following:
911.1 Flre Command Center

Page 13 of 18



Building Code

16. Ba

The guantity must be as §pec1fled by the fire de partment.
17 A current Ii st f el with:phone numbers

(79) A new Section 912.1 is hereby added:
912.1 Fire Pump.

conn tion

%%Ma%%%mwﬂ%ﬂw%%%d%%m-
approved-fire-hose;-an-approved-shut-off-valve-nozzle,-and-couplings;-and-an-approved-raclk-or-cabinet-for-
o) Tl . Section 01573 are herebydeleted-in thei ot
(dd) Seetions-948-4-through-918-4-6-are-amended-by-deleting-thesame-in-their-entirety-and-sabstiuting -
hiew-thereof-the following:

—9—1—8—4—\¥hefe-Requed— A-ﬂfe-pfetee&%-s*g&&lﬂg-sﬁem—shau-be-msfaﬂed-aﬂd-

91-8—4—-2—Use-Gfeu-p—Ar8— A-ﬁfe-pfeteeﬁveﬁgﬂa}mg-system—shaﬂ—be-ms%&ﬂed—&nd-
maintained -in-all -buildings-of Use -Group-A-3-which-exceed -total-floot-area-of 2;500 -square-feet-or-have-

94—8—44-Use-Gfeu-p-F—1—-F—2--aﬂdM— A—ﬁfe-pfeteeﬁ%ﬁig&a}mg-system-shaﬂ-beqﬂsmﬂeé
MW%&W#&%H%MM%%&%M%M&%

Page 14 of 18



Building Code

mmﬁﬁmd%&m%ﬂé%mmmmm%-

éfrB mwﬁmwmmm—hbmﬁmmmmﬂmm
feet 22860 -mm) -abeove -the Jowest devel -of -Eire -Department -vehiele -aeeess -which -are -used for -hurman -
(28 - Seetion -9H18-8-1 -is -mmended -by -deleting -the -words and -areas -of -buildings -houstng -the -hearing -
i

thh)--Section-921-2-is-amended-by-deleting-item-numbet-one-ta-its-entirety-and-substituting-in-lea-thereof -

&]—) See&en%%amendedbyddeﬂg%he%%se&ﬁe&y-mé%&b%ﬁgmhe&&eﬁef&e-
folowing:

1024 1 Hire -Suppression -Systems: --All -automatic fire -suppression-systems-shall -be -supervised -by-
shal-transmit-alarm-and-trouble-signals—
ékk-} Se%%ﬁ%d%dehﬁg&e%ﬂs—mﬂppmeéemmw

p%ﬂ%%ﬁ&ﬁe%%%m&mm%%ﬂdwd&mgﬂw
thereto-exeeptforException No—2-
(H80) Section 924-0 is amended by adding the following Section 9234.3:

“Seetion-924.3. Exemption.

In lieu of connecting to the Village alarm receiving panels as set forth above, any property within
the municipal limits of Downers Grove which is under the jurisdiction of a fire protection district organized
pursuant to state law shall instead connect to the alarm receiving panels of the fire protection district. Such
alternative connection shall be according to the fire protection district's rules and regulations for such
connection."

thereof the followmg,
National Electric Code as adopted and amended by the Village

(85) Sectio 5 ¢
in lieu thereof the fgllgwmg

Page 15 of 18



Building Code

- See&eﬂ—BOHﬁﬂmeﬂdedbyaddmgﬁeieﬂewﬂgseﬂfeneeﬂHheeeﬂehmneﬂhe
ﬁfsf-p&i‘&gfﬂph-t-hefe}ﬁ— %&m%em&haﬂﬂpply—mﬁaeﬂeabb—%ﬂdé&eﬂs%eﬁemdehﬂg

1301.2 ComCheck/Inspectlon List Regulred

A ComCheck report and. inspection list will need to accompany plans for new commercial
constructlon and common dddltlons of over 250:square feet. The ComCheck report will need to be stam ped

out in the ComCheck report-and the inspection teport.

(87)  Section 1405.10.4 is amended by deleting the words "ICC Electric:
thereof the fg!]gwmg

Lieu thereof the following: v
Iilinois State Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village

in heu:thereof the following: -
Illinois State Plumbing Co 0 mend the Village

following:
3002. 4 Elevator Car Slze

SMErgency. access to all ﬂoors Such eleval
the horizontal open position without any-adjus

bﬁmmwm%mwwﬁmm%ﬁ&@%ﬁ%m%—
required-at-the-tep-heistway-

93 ection 3105 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety.

Page 16 of 18



Building Code

of the following shall apply",
97 g:hgp ter-3 2is amended by deleting the same in its:éntirety.

fuel—éer—elee&ieal)—s&pp%yhsha}kbefese&by—mm&&ahneanﬁ-eﬂbe

(un) - That -the 1996 JCC International Mechanical -Code -as -adopted -by reference -in -the 1996 BOCA -
National -Building -Code -is -hereby -amended -by -adding -the -folowing -exeeption -to -Seetion -606.0 System -
Centrol:

s%eﬁ‘-b&ﬁd-m-g— —Dﬁe@ﬁmd@daeetefs-afeﬂeﬁequeé-pfewdedﬁe%ﬁyswmﬁuppheseﬁy —a-smgle

m%wm%mﬂ%%%%%%m%&m —A:B
everride -switch -maay -be -installed -to prevent -damage -to equipment -for testing -purpeses; -activation -of -this-

(Ord. No. 1281, § 15; Ord. No. 1370, § 1; Ord. No. 1586, §§ 2, 3, 6; Ord. No. 1747, § 1; Ord. No. 1846, § 1,
Ord. No, 2020, § 1; Ord. No. 2089, §§ 1, 2; Ord. No. 2116, § 2; Ord. No. 2122, § 1; Ord. No. 2143, § 4,
Ord. No, 2151, §§ 1, 2; Ord. No. 2208, § 1; Ord. No. 2209, § 1; Ord. No. 2397, § 1; Ord. No. 2547, § 2;

Page 17 of 18



Building Code

Ord. No. 2563, § 1; Ord. No. 2584, § 3; Ord. No. 2608, § 2; Ord. No. 2709, § 1; Ord. No. 2768, §1; Ord. No.
2857, § 3; Ord. No. 3118, § 2; Ord. No. 3184, § 3; Ord. No. 3193, § 1; Ord. No. 3391, § 3.)

Section 4. That all ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are

hereby repealed.

Section 5. That this ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and publication

in the manner provided by law.

Mayor

Passed:
Published:
Attest:

Village Clerk

Page 18 of 18



